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"Identification Crisis" 

At the threshold of adolescence, the self-image 
collapses. Similarly, in old age there is a shattering of 
the reality of the old person. In both cases the 
psychiatrists speak of an "Identification Crisis". But 
there are great differences. The adolescent realizes 
that he is going through a period of transition; his body 
is changing, and it torments him. The aged person 
comes to feel that he is old through others, and without 
having experienced important changes. His inner 
being does not accept the label that has been stuck to 
him. He no longer knows who he is. 

The Working of the Unconscious Mind 

The psychoanalyst Martin Grotjhan, states that 
our unconscious mind konws nothing of old age: it 
clings to the illusion of perpetual youth. When this 
illusion is shattered, in many cases it causes a 
narcissistic traumatism that gives rise to a depressive 
psychosis. Also, the adult associates age with fanta­
sies of castration, weakening or obliterating his sexual­
ity. Among those aspects of old age that are most 
unrealizable, this is the one that consciously and 
unconsciously, man is most reluctant to accept. 

Positive attitudes toward old age 

For a man who is sure of himself, who is contented 
with his lot and who is on good terms with those around 
him, age remains theoretical. One who has had a 
happy chilhood, has been brought up in an atmosphere 
of love and affection, reacts positively to old age. Also if 
he has spent his youth constructively building up his 
interests and developing his potential, using his body 
and physical energy in moderation, similarly his view of 
old age is positive. 

Optimistic view in spite of physical infirmities 

Very often the burden of the body counts for less 
than the attitude that is adopted towards it. Claudel 
wrote : "Eighty years old! No eyes left, no ears, no 

teeth, no legs! And when all is said and done, how 
astonishingly well one does without them!" Voltaire 
also had a positive attitude towards his age; he wrote 
"The heart does not grow old, but it is sad to dwell 
among ruins. I undergo all the calamities connected 
with decrepitude". But he was wealthy, famous and 
revered; he was busier than ever, passionately con­
cerned with what he was writing, and he accepted his 
condition with serenity. 

Determination to keep fit and active 

Exercising the muscles in good sports activities 
and keeping the body in good shape reveals the 
determination of the old to remain fit and active till the 
last day of their life. The will to keep up to date in all 
areas of life motivates the old person to use all his 
physical, intellectual and social assets for constructive 
and creative work. The mind and the body are very 
closely linked. Good health encourages the survival of 
emotional and intellectual interests. Most of the time 
the mind and body travel together towards their growth 
or their decline. 

Conclusion 

The immense majority of old people live in hunger, 
cold and disease. Such is the real condition of old 
people and we cannot be optimistic about old age. 
Experience is in direct contradiction with the notion that 
age brings freedom from carnal desire. At the first 
beginnings of old age the body may retain its former 
vigour or reach a new state of equilibrium. But in the 
course of years it deteriorates, grows burdensome and 
hinders the activities of the mind. The old person is no 
longer capable of what he desires. He forms a project, 
and then just when it is to be carried out his body fails 
him. When this happens, old age is experienced and 
the sufferer feels the anguish of losing his grasp upon 
himself. 

Age is an inescapable fact of life that we try to 
avoid as long as we can until it takes hold of us. It is a 
sad truth which can, however, be made bearable and 
acceptable if society takes it seriously and responsibly 
through various ways by extending help, humanity and 
warmth. 
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Rest House "Oznam", Batroun, Lebanon 

On the occasion of the International Year of the 
Elderly and the 150th Anniversary of the St. Vincent de 
Paul Society in Lebanon, the Batroun Section of this 
society has finished the elaboration of the project of a 
rest house for the elderly, named "Oznam" , which will 
be erected in Batroun, Marje Square, near the old road 
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to Mseilha Castle. The laying of the first stone of the 
building took place on April 19, 1982. The ceremony 
was presided over by Father Richard McCullen, 
Superior General of the Lazarist Fathers and the 
Sisters of Charity. 
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